WATER METERS

Bid Results
Bid 2017-601 Water Meters and ERTs
Opened April 3,2017 2:000 PM
TENTATIVE AWARD DATE: May 23, 2017

RECOMMENDED AWARD TO MOUNTAIN STATES PIPE & SUPPLY AND RESOURCE WISE LLC

BAKER UTILITY SUPPLY CORPORATION

MOUNTAIN STATES PIPE & SUPPLY CO

MEETS MEETS
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | SPECIFICATION | UNIT COST TOTAL DELIVERY EST BID AWARD |SPECIFICATION| UNIT COST TOTAL DELIVERY EST BID AWARD
1 |[5/8"x 3/4" 20 ea NO $ 124.29| % 2,485.80 4 WEEKS NO YES $ 97.50 | $ 1,950.00 STOCK NO
2 |1 ea NO $ 182.00| $ 910.00 4 WEEKS NO YES $ 221.90| $ 1,109.50 STOCK NO
3 |11/2" ea NO $ 463.00| $ 926.00 4 WEEKS NO YES $ 348.00| $ 696.00 STOCK NO
4 2" 30 ea NO $ 618.00( $ 18,540.00 4 WEEKS NO YES $ 462.00 | $13,860.00 STOCK NO
ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METERS
1 |3 ea NO BID YES $ 2,375.00| $ 4,750.00 STOCK YES
4" ea NO BID YES $ 2,665.00( $ 7,995.00 STOCK YES
5" ea NO BID YES $ 4,195.00| $ 4,195.00 STOCK YES
FLOW METER
1 |FLEXIM 7407 ULTRASONIC FLOW METER | 1 | ea NO BID YES $13,452.30 | $13,452.30 4 WEEKS NO
ITRON ERTSs
1 |ITRON ERT 100 WE | 63 | ea YES $ 124.00| $ 7,812.00 4 WEEKS NO YES $ 74.60 | $ 4,699.80 3 -5 DAYS YES
Total Bid $ 30,673.80 $52,707.60
Total Comparison Including 5% NM State Preference $  29,140.11 N/A
Total Comparison Including 10% (Maximum) Resident
Veteran Preference N/A N/A
WATER METERS RESOURCE WISE. LLC
MEETS
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT [ SPECIFICATION | UNIT COST TOTAL DELIVERY EST BID AWARD
1 |[5/8"x 3/4" 20 ea YES $ 95.50 | $ 1,910.00 STOCK YES
2 |1 ea YES $ 210.00| $ 1,050.00 STOCK YES
3 |11/2" ea YES $ 351.00| $ 702.00 STOCK YES
4 2" 30 ea YES $ 446.00 $ 13,380.00 STOCK YES
ELECTROMAGNETIC WATER METERS
1 |3 ea NO $ 2,375.00 4,750.00 STOCK NO
4" ea NO $ 2,700.00 [ $ 8,100.00 4 - 6 WEEKS NO
5" ea NO $ 3,260.00 | $ 3,260.00 4 -6 WEEKS NO
FLOW METER
1 |FLEXIM 7407 ULTRASONIC FLOW METER | 1 | ea YES $13,129.00 | $ 13,129.00 2 - 3 WEEKS YES
ITRON ERTSs
1 [ITRON ERT 100 WE [ 63 | ea NO $  78.75|$  4,961.25 | 2- 3 WEEKS NO
Total Bid $ 51,242.25
Total Comparison Including 5% NM State Preference $  48,680.14
Total Comparison Including 10% (Maximum) Resident
Veteran Preference N/A




