ANNUAL CHEMICAL SUPPLY - TREATMENT PLANTS

BID #2018-659

BID DATE: JUNE 20, 2018 3:00PM

SCHEDULE AWARD DATE: JUNE 26, 2018

Bid award recommendations to City Commission: Chemtrade Bid Item #1; DPC Industries Bid Items 2, 3, & 5; SNF Inc Bid Item #4

Liquid Aluminum Sulfate
48% (bulk-truckload)

Sodium Hypochlorite —
10% solution

Ferric Chloride — UN2582
40% Solution Strength

Clarifloc C4266 Or
equivalent (polymer)

Methanol

LIQUID TON BULK GALLONS 300 GALLON TOTE 55 GALLON DRUM 345 GALLON TOTE
BID COMPANY BID ITEM #1 BID ITEM #2 BID ITEM #3 BID ITEM #4 BID ITEM #5
1 |CHEMTRADE $195.29/liquid ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1,005/tot
> égaéooﬂs $1,016.60/tote
DPC INDUSTRIES No Bid 1.45/bulk gall ' No Bid 2.99/gal
5 s »L.45/bulkgallon | 5 10 4 totes 270 s 343 . t/ftae
gal tote  $3.722/gal g
NM Residenital Preference 5% $1.3775/bulk gallon 3.5359/gal $2.8405/gal
3 KEMIRA WATER SOLUTIONS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |SNFINC No Bid No Bid No Bid $621.00/drum No Bid
5 STERLING WATER TECHNOLOGIES No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$959.75/tote
1,560/tote $5.67/gall
6  THATCHER COMPANY $218.00/liquid ton $1.84/bulk gallon | *L280/tote 55.67/gallon NoBid  $3.49/gal 275
275 gallon tote
gallon tote
$1,043.98/tote
7 UNIVAR USA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.0978/gal

337 gal tote




